

Contract ID: P500.493
 Letting Date: 06-05-18

Project(s): 080C00001

Call Order: 493

BID FORM/SCHEDULE OF PRICES

INTERCHANGE 117 TOLL UTILITY
 BUILDING REHABILITATION

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 104
 Control of Work

| | | | | | |
|------|---------------------|------|------|--|------|
| 0001 | Construction Layout | | | | |
| | 104-0001 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0002 | Mobilization | | | | |
| | 104-0002 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 104 | | | | |
| | Control of Work | | | | |

SECTION 107
 Prosecution and Progress

| | | | | | |
|------|--------------------------|------|------|--|------|
| 0003 | Progress Schedule | | | | |
| | 107-0001 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 107 | | | | |
| | Prosecution and Progress | | | | |

SECTION 108
 Measurement and Payment

| | | | | | |
|------|--------------------------------|-----------|-----|------|-----------|
| 0004 | Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) | | | | |
| | 108-0001 | 10,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 10,000.00 |

New Jersey
Turnpike Authority
Schedule of Items

Page: 2
Date: 05-07-18
Revised:
Revised:

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|-------------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| | TOTAL | | | | 10,000.00 |
| | SECTION 108 | | | | |
| | Measurement and Payment | | | | |

SECTION 2000
Building Work

| | | | | | |
|------|--|-----------|------|------|-----------|
| 0040 | Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) | | | | |
| | 2000-N007 | 40,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 40,000.00 |
| 0041 | Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) | | | | |
| | 2000-N008 | 10,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 10,000.00 |
| 0042 | Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 | | | | |
| | 2000-N009 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0043 | Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 | | | | |
| | 2000-N015 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0044 | Building Architectural Work - Location No. | | | | |
| | 1 | | | | |
| | 2000-N025 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0045 | Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1 | | | | |
| | 2000-N026 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0046 | Building Fire Protection Work - Location | | | | |
| | No. 1 | | | | |
| | 2000-N027 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0047 | Site Electrical Work | | | | |
| | 2000-N028 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| 0048 | Demolition of Buildings (1) | | | | |
| | 2000-N029 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |

(Contains bid errors)

Check: D38940A9 Page 2

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------|------|------------|------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS | CT |
| 0049 | NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) 2000-N030 | 50,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 50,000.00 |
| 0050 | Universal Waste Removal (No-Bid) 2000-N031 | 10,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 10,000.00 |
| 0051 | Mold Remediation (No-Bid) 2000-N032 | 40,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 40,000.00 |
| TOTAL SECTION 200 Building Work | | | | | 150,000.00 |

SECTION 201
 Clearing And Grubbing

| | | | | | |
|---|-----------------------------------|------|------|--|------|
| 0005 | Clearing and Grubbing 201-0002 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| TOTAL SECTION 201 Clearing And Grubbing | | | | | 0.00 |

SECTION 202
 Roadway Excavation

| | | | | | |
|------|---------------------------------------|-------|------|--|--|
| 0006 | Roadway Excavation, Earth 202-0002 | 29.00 | C.Y. | | |
| 0007 | Stripping Topsoil 202-0007 | 4.00 | C.Y. | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|---|---------------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 202 | | | | | |
| Roadway Excavation | | | | | |
| SECTION 205 | | | | | |
| Foundation Excavation | | | | | |
| 0008 | Coarse Aggregate Layer | | | | |
| | 205-0002 | 13.00 | C.Y. | | |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 205 | | | | | |
| Foundation Excavation | | | | | |
| SECTION 208 | | | | | |
| Temporary Soil Erosion And Dust Control | | | | | |
| 0009 | Heavy Duty Silt Fence | | | | |
| | 208-0008 | 425.00 | L.F. | | |
| 0010 | Inlet Filter, Type 2 | | | | |
| | 208-0022 | 2.00 | Each | | |
| 0011 | Concrete Washout Facility | | | | |
| | 208-N0001 | 1.00 | Each | | |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 208 | | | | | |
| Temporary Soil Erosion And Dust Control | | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 213
Regulated Material

| | | | | | |
|------|--------------------------------|------|-----|--|------|
| 0012 | Disposal of Regulated Material | | | | |
| | 213-0002 | 5.00 | Ton | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 213 | | | | |
| | Regulated Material | | | | |

SECTION 301
Aggregate Base Course

| | | | | | |
|------|----------------------------------|------|------|--|------|
| 0013 | Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick | | | | |
| | 301-0002 | 8.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 301 | | | | |
| | Aggregate Base Course | | | | |

SECTION 302
Hot Mix Asphalt (HMA) Pavements

| | | | | | |
|------|-----------------------------------|-------|-----|--|--|
| 0014 | Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course | | | | |
| | 302-0004 | 2.00 | Ton | | |
| 0015 | Tack Coat | | | | |
| | 302-0064 | 67.00 | GAL | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|---|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| 0016 | Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course 302-0073 | 98.00 | Ton | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 302 Hot Mix Asphalt (HMA) Pavements | | | | |
| | SECTION 303 Shoulder And Berm Surfacing | | | | |
| 0017 | Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4In Thick 303-N0004 | 17.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 303 Shoulder And Berm Surfacing | | | | |
| | SECTION 305 Pavement Removal And Surface Milling | | | | |
| 0018 | Pavement Removal, 2in Depth 305-0006 | 821.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 305 Pavement Removal And Surface Milling | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 401
 Concrete Structures

| | | | | | |
|------|---------------------|--------|----|--|------|
| 0019 | Reinforcement Steel | | | | |
| | 401-0066 | 265.00 | LB | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 401 | | | | |
| | Concrete Structures | | | | |

SECTION 502
 Storm Drains

| | | | | | |
|------|--------------------------------|--------|------|--|------|
| 0020 | Cleaning Existing Storm Drains | | | | |
| | 502-0251 | 150.00 | L.F. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 502 | | | | |
| | Storm Drains | | | | |

SECTION 504
 Minor Concrete Structures And Incidental Concrete

| | | | | | |
|------|---------------------|-------|------|--|--|
| 0021 | Incidental Concrete | | | | |
| | 504-0011 | 20.00 | C.Y. | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|--|-----------------------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 504 Minor Concrete Structures And Incidental Concrete | | | | | |
| SECTION 506 Concrete Curb | | | | | |
| 0022 | 9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb | | | | |
| | 506-0003 | 35.00 | L.F. | | |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 506 Concrete Curb | | | | | |
| SECTION 509 Sign Panels | | | | | |
| 0023 | Sign Panels | | | | |
| | 509-0001 | 11.00 | S.F. | | |
| 0024 | U-channel Post | | | | |
| | 509-0002 | 30.00 | L.F. | | |
| TOTAL | | | | | 0.00 |
| SECTION 509 Sign Panels | | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 514
 Sidewalks and Islands

| | | | | | |
|------|------------------------------|--------|------|--|------|
| 0025 | Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick | | | | |
| | 514-0001 | 100.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 514 | | | | |
| | Sidewalks and Islands | | | | |

SECTION 516
 Pavement Stripes And Markings

| | | | | | |
|------|---|--------|------|--|------|
| 0026 | Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic | | | | |
| | 516-0009 | 500.00 | L.F. | | |
| 0027 | Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, | | | | |
| | Thermoplastic | | | | |
| | 516-0013 | 16.00 | S.F. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 516 | | | | |
| | Pavement Stripes And Markings | | | | |

SECTION 517
 Field Office

| | | | | | |
|------|------------------------------|------|------|--|--|
| 0028 | Furnish Field Office, Type C | | | | |
| | 517-0003 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|---|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| 0029 | Maintain Field Office, Type C 517-0009 | 10.00 | Mnth | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 517 | | | | |
| | Field Office | | | | |
| | SECTION 522 | | | | |
| | Test Pits | | | | |
| 0030 | Test Pits 522-0001 | 5.00 | Each | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 522 | | | | |
| | Test Pits | | | | |
| | SECTION 528 | | | | |
| | Resetting Of Existing Junction Boxes | | | | |
| 0031 | Reset Junction Box 528-0001 | 2.00 | Each | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 528 | | | | |
| | Resetting Of Existing Junction Boxes | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|------------|------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 599
Non-Standard Division 500

| | | | | | |
|------|-------------------------------|-----------|------|------|-----------|
| 0032 | Project Allowances (No-Bid) | | | | |
| | 599-N0003 | 50,000.00 | USD | 1.00 | 50,000.00 |
| 0033 | 2in Plastic Gas Main | | | | |
| | 599-N0018 | 10.00 | L.F. | | |
| 0034 | Bollards | | | | |
| | 599-N0022 | 3.00 | Each | | |
| 0035 | 2in Copper Water Pipe, Type K | | | | |
| | 599-N0023 | 80.00 | L.F. | | |
| 0036 | 2in Water Valve | | | | |
| | 599-N0024 | 1.00 | Each | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 50,000.00 |
| | SECTION 599 | | | | |
| | Non-Standard Division 500 | | | | |

SECTION 703
Topsoiling

| | | | | | |
|------|-------------|-------|------|--|------|
| 0037 | Topsoil | | | | |
| | 703-0001 | 42.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 703 | | | | |
| | Topsoiling | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
 Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |

SECTION 704
 Seeding And Sodding

| | | | | | |
|------|---------------------|-------|------|--|------|
| 0038 | Seeding, Type C | | | | |
| | 704-0003 | 42.00 | S.Y. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 704 | | | | |
| | Seeding And Sodding | | | | |

SECTION 803
 State; County And Local Roadways

| | | | | | |
|------|--|------|------|--|------|
| 0039 | Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on | | | | |
| | Location No. 1 | | | | |
| | 803-0001 | 1.00 | L.S. | | |
| | TOTAL | | | | 0.00 |
| | SECTION 803 | | | | |
| | State; County And Local Roadways | | | | |

Contract ID: P500.493 Project(s): 080C00001
Letting Date: 06-05-18 Call Order: 493

Bidder: 00881 - Hall Building Corporation

| LINE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT |
|--------------------------------------|------------------|----------|------|--------------|--------------|
| | | | | DOLLARS CT | DOLLARS CT |
| | TOTAL PRICE | | | | 210,000.00 |
| (THIS SPACE FOR DEPARTMENT USE ONLY) | | | | | |

NOTE: THE TOTAL PRICE, AS CORRECTLY DETERMINED FROM THE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES LISTED AND THE PRICES PER UNIT OF MEASURE BID RESPECTIVELY THEREFORE, WILL BE CONSIDERED TO BE THE AMOUNT BID FOR THE PROJECT, AND THE CORRECT TOTAL PRICE WILL CONTROL IN AWARDING THE CONTRACT AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 103 OF THE SPECIFICATIONS.